
Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>

Tom Price
7 messages

Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com> Tue, Feb 21, 2023 at 1:41 PM
To: dbeckwit@good-sam.com

Deb,

I just want to confirm that the March billing will be the last payment due, please confirm.

Jeff

--
Disclaimer:  This email is intended only for the use of the party to which it is addressed and may contain information that
is privileged, confidential, or protected by law.  If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any
dissemination, copying or distribution of this email or its contents is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message
in error, please notify us immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer.

Beckwith,Deborah <dbeckwit@good-sam.com> Tue, Feb 21, 2023 at 2:14 PM
To: Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>
Cc: "Million,Robert" <robert.million@good-sam.com>

Hi Jeff,

I am coping Rob on this so my Business Office is aware. 

If you have your Dad out by the last day of February, we will not be charging for March.  Rob can confirm that with
whoever is paying your Dad’s rent.

 

I need to confirm with you that he is transferring to an Assisted Living facility.  If he moves to a higher level of care, we
terminate the agreement.  If he is moving to another Independent Living facility, then we need a 30 day notice, per
the Occupancy Agreement that he signed at move-in.

Can you please let me know where he is headed?

 

Lastly, who’s address or phone # do we use for forwarding mail?

 

Thank you

 

Deb Beckwith

Senior Living Administrator | Cedar Lake Village

15325 S Lone Elm Rd, Olathe, KS  66061
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Phone: (913) 780-9916 | Email: dbeckwit@good-sam.com  | Fax:  (913)768-8903

www.cedarlakevillagekc.org | www.good-sam.com |  facebook.com/cedarlakevillagekc

 

 

 

 

 

 

From: Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 21, 2023 1:42 PM
To: Beckwith,Deborah <dbeckwit@good-sam.com>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Tom Price

 

Deb,

 

I just want to confirm that the March billing will be the last
payment due, please confirm.

 

Jeff
 

--

Disclaimer:  This email is intended only for the use of the party to which it is addressed and may contain information that
is privileged, confidential, or protected by law.  If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any
dissemination, copying or distribution of this email or its contents is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message
in error, please notify us immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail message, including any attachments,
is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain
privileged and confidential information.  Any unauthorized review, use,
disclosure or distribution is prohibited.  If you are not the intended
recipient, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy
all copies of the original message.

Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com> Tue, Feb 21, 2023 at 2:18 PM
To: "Dan C. Sanders" <dsanders@kcattorneys.net>, dkirk121@yahoo.com
Bcc: Amy Lucinda Julo <amyj1966@att.net>

David & Dan,
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Hold the horses, we do not have to pay March.

Email form Deb forwarded. 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Beckwith,Deborah <dbeckwit@good-sam.com>
Date: Tue, Feb 21, 2023 at 2:14 PM
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Tom Price
To: Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>
Cc: Million,Robert <robert.million@good-sam.com>

Hi Jeff,

I am coping Rob on this so my Business Office is aware. 

If you have your Dad out by the last day of February, we will not be charging for March.  Rob can confirm that with
whoever is paying your Dad’s rent.

 

I need to confirm with you that he is transferring to an Assisted Living facility.  If he moves to a higher level of care, we
terminate the agreement.  If he is moving to another Independent Living facility, then we need a 30 day notice, per
the Occupancy Agreement that he signed at move-in.

Can you please let me know where he is headed?

 

Lastly, who’s address or phone # do we use for forwarding mail?

 

Thank you

 

Deb Beckwith

Senior Living Administrator | Cedar Lake Village

15325 S Lone Elm Rd, Olathe, KS  66061

 

Phone: (913) 780-9916 | Email: dbeckwit@good-sam.com  | Fax:  (913)768-8903

www.cedarlakevillagekc.org | www.good-sam.com |  facebook.com/cedarlakevillagekc
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From: Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 21, 2023 1:42 PM
To: Beckwith,Deborah <dbeckwit@good-sam.com>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Tom Price

 

Deb,

 

I just want to confirm that the March billing will be the last
payment due, please confirm.

 

Jeff
 

--

Disclaimer:  This email is intended only for the use of the party to which it is addressed and may contain information that
is privileged, confidential, or protected by law.  If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any
dissemination, copying or distribution of this email or its contents is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message
in error, please notify us immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail message, including any attachments,
is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain
privileged and confidential information.  Any unauthorized review, use,
disclosure or distribution is prohibited.  If you are not the intended
recipient, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy
all copies of the original message.

--
Disclaimer:  This email is intended only for the use of the party to which it is addressed and may contain information that
is privileged, confidential, or protected by law.  If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any
dissemination, copying or distribution of this email or its contents is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message
in error, please notify us immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer.

Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com> Tue, Feb 21, 2023 at 2:20 PM
To: "Beckwith,Deborah" <dbeckwit@good-sam.com>
Cc: "Million,Robert" <robert.million@good-sam.com>
Bcc: Amy Lucinda Julo <amyj1966@att.net>

Deb,

He is moving to Assisted Living at Benton House of Lenexa.  I have notified everyone
not to pay the March invoice.

On Tue, Feb 21, 2023 at 2:14 PM Beckwith,Deborah <dbeckwit@good-sam.com> wrote:

Hi Jeff,

I am coping Rob on this so my Business Office is aware. 

8/15/24, 7:38 PM Gmail - Tom Price
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If you have your Dad out by the last day of February, we will not be charging for March.  Rob can confirm that with
whoever is paying your Dad’s rent.

 

I need to confirm with you that he is transferring to an Assisted Living facility.  If he moves to a higher level of care,
we terminate the agreement.  If he is moving to another Independent Living facility, then we need a 30 day notice,
per the Occupancy Agreement that he signed at move-in.

Can you please let me know where he is headed?

 

Lastly, who’s address or phone # do we use for forwarding mail?

 

Thank you

 

Deb Beckwith

Senior Living Administrator | Cedar Lake Village

15325 S Lone Elm Rd, Olathe, KS  66061

 

Phone: (913) 780-9916 | Email: dbeckwit@good-sam.com  | Fax:  (913)768-8903

www.cedarlakevillagekc.org | www.good-sam.com |  facebook.com/cedarlakevillagekc

 

 

 

 

 

 

From: Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 21, 2023 1:42 PM
To: Beckwith,Deborah <dbeckwit@good-sam.com>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Tom Price

 

Deb,

 

I just want to confirm that the March billing will be the last
payment due, please confirm.
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Jeff
 

--

Disclaimer:  This email is intended only for the use of the party to which it is addressed and may contain information
that is privileged, confidential, or protected by law.  If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any
dissemination, copying or distribution of this email or its contents is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
message in error, please notify us immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail message, including any attachments,
is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain
privileged and confidential information.  Any unauthorized review, use,
disclosure or distribution is prohibited.  If you are not the intended
recipient, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy
all copies of the original message.

--
Disclaimer:  This email is intended only for the use of the party to which it is addressed and may contain information that
is privileged, confidential, or protected by law.  If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any
dissemination, copying or distribution of this email or its contents is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message
in error, please notify us immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer.

Beckwith,Deborah <dbeckwit@good-sam.com> Tue, Feb 21, 2023 at 2:24 PM
To: Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>
Cc: "Million,Robert" <robert.million@good-sam.com>

thanks

 

From: Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 21, 2023 2:21 PM
To: Beckwith,Deborah <dbeckwit@good-sam.com>
Cc: Million,Robert <robert.million@good-sam.com>
Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] Tom Price

 

Deb,

 

He is moving to Assisted Living at Benton House of Lenexa.  I
have notified everyone not to pay the March invoice.
 

On Tue, Feb 21, 2023 at 2:14 PM Beckwith,Deborah <dbeckwit@good-sam.com> wrote:

Hi Jeff,

I am coping Rob on this so my Business Office is aware. 
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If you have your Dad out by the last day of February, we will not be charging for March.  Rob can confirm that with
whoever is paying your Dad’s rent.

 

I need to confirm with you that he is transferring to an Assisted Living facility.  If he moves to a higher level of care,
we terminate the agreement.  If he is moving to another Independent Living facility, then we need a 30 day notice,
per the Occupancy Agreement that he signed at move-in.

Can you please let me know where he is headed?

 

Lastly, who’s address or phone # do we use for forwarding mail?

 

Thank you

 

Deb Beckwith

Senior Living Administrator | Cedar Lake Village

15325 S Lone Elm Rd, Olathe, KS  66061

 

Phone: (913) 780-9916 | Email: dbeckwit@good-sam.com  | Fax:  (913)768-8903

www.cedarlakevillagekc.org | www.good-sam.com |  facebook.com/cedarlakevillagekc

 

 

 

 

 

 

From: Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 21, 2023 1:42 PM
To: Beckwith,Deborah <dbeckwit@good-sam.com>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Tom Price

 

Deb,

 

I just want to confirm that the March billing will be the last
payment due, please confirm.
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Jeff
 

--

Disclaimer:  This email is intended only for the use of the party to which it is addressed and may contain information
that is privileged, confidential, or protected by law.  If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any
dissemination, copying or distribution of this email or its contents is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
message in error, please notify us immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer.

-----------------------------------------------------------------------
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail message, including any attachments,
is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain
privileged and confidential information.  Any unauthorized review, use,
disclosure or distribution is prohibited.  If you are not the intended
recipient, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy
all copies of the original message.

 

--

Disclaimer:  This email is intended only for the use of the party to which it is addressed and may contain information that
is privileged, confidential, or protected by law.  If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any
dissemination, copying or distribution of this email or its contents is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message
in error, please notify us immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail message, including any attachments,
is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain
privileged and confidential information.  Any unauthorized review, use,
disclosure or distribution is prohibited.  If you are not the intended
recipient, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy
all copies of the original message.

David Kirk <dkirk121@yahoo.com> Wed, Feb 22, 2023 at 9:12 AM
Reply-To: David Kirk <dkirk121@yahoo.com>
To: Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>, Michelle Burge <mburge@countslawkc.com>, "Dan C. Sanders"
<dsanders@kcattorneys.net>, "Jon A. Blongewicz" <blongewicz@leawoodattorneys.com>, "leslie@byramlaw.com"
<leslie@byramlaw.com>

I got a call from Cedar Lake Village yesterday.  The lady told me that she would pull back the bill
she sent to Edward Jones for March, 2023 and that there is no notice requirement when someone
moves to a higher level of care than what is currently provided.

So, no 30 day notice.  No March payment to Cedar Lake.

Edward Jones is scheduled to make the March 1 payment to the new placement.

David C. Kirk
8000 Foster
Overland Park, KS 66204

8/15/24, 7:38 PM Gmail - Tom Price
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Mailing:
P.O. Box 13304
Overland Park, KS 66282 
913 940-7600
Fax: 913 642-5860
E-Mail: dkirk121@yahoo.com

If you are not the intended recipient of this email, the sender requests that you destroy this email.

On Tuesday, February 21, 2023 at 02:18:57 PM CST, Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com> wrote:

David & Dan,

Hold the horses, we do not have to pay March.

Email form Deb forwarded. 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Beckwith,Deborah <dbeckwit@good-sam.com>
Date: Tue, Feb 21, 2023 at 2:14 PM
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Tom Price
To: Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>
Cc: Million,Robert <robert.million@good-sam.com>

Hi Jeff,

I am coping Rob on this so my Business Office is aware. 

If you have your Dad out by the last day of February, we will not be charging for March.  Rob can confirm
that with whoever is paying your Dad’s rent.

 

I need to confirm with you that he is transferring to an Assisted Living facility.  If he moves to a higher level
of care, we terminate the agreement.  If he is moving to another Independent Living facility, then we need a
30 day notice, per the Occupancy Agreement that he signed at move-in.

Can you please let me know where he is headed?

 

Lastly, who’s address or phone # do we use for forwarding mail?

 

Thank you

 

Deb Beckwith

Senior Living Administrator | Cedar Lake Village

15325 S Lone Elm Rd, Olathe, KS  66061
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Phone: (913) 780-9916 | Email: dbeckwit@good-sam.com  | Fax:  (913)768-8903

www.cedarlakevillagekc.org | www.good-sam.com |  facebook.com/cedarlakevillagekc

 

 

 

 

 

 

From: Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 21, 2023 1:42 PM
To: Beckwith,Deborah <dbeckwit@good-sam.com>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Tom Price

 

Deb,

 

I just want to confirm that the March billing will be the last
payment due, please confirm.

 

Jeff
 

--

Disclaimer:  This email is intended only for the use of the party to which it is addressed and may contain information that
is privileged, confidential, or protected by law.  If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any
dissemination, copying or distribution of this email or its contents is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message
in error, please notify us immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer.
-----------------------------------------------------------------------
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail message, including any attachments,
is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain
privileged and confidential information.  Any unauthorized review, use,
disclosure or distribution is prohibited.  If you are not the intended
recipient, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy
all copies of the original message.

--
Disclaimer:  This email is intended only for the use of the party to which it is addressed and may contain information that
is privileged, confidential, or protected by law.  If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any
dissemination, copying or distribution of this email or its contents is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message
in error, please notify us immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer.

Dan C. Sanders <dsanders@kcattorneys.net> Wed, Feb 22, 2023 at 10:19 AM
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To: Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>

 

 

 

 

Dan C. Sanders

MONACO, SANDERS, RACINE, & POWELL, L.L.C.

8700 State Line Road, Suite 110

Leawood, Kansas 66206

Main: (816) 523-2400, ext. 2

Direct dial: (816) 209-6837

Fax: (816) 942-0006

dsanders@kcattorneys.net

 

==========================================================================================

This message is from the offices of Monaco, Sanders, Racine & Powell, L.C. and is intended only for the addressee.  The
information contained in this message is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute inside or non-public
information under federal or state securities laws and is intended only for the use of the addressee.  Unauthorized forwarding,
printing, copying, distributing, or using of such information is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.  If you are not the
addressee, please promptly delete this message and notify the sender of the delivery error by return e-mail or you may call us at
(816) 523-2400.

==========================================================================================

 

From: David Kirk <dkirk121@yahoo.com>
Sent: Wednesday, February 22, 2023 9:13 AM
To: Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>; Michelle Burge <mburge@countslawkc.com>; Dan C. Sanders
<dsanders@kcattorneys.net>; Jon A. Blongewicz <blongewicz@leawoodattorneys.com>; leslie@byramlaw.com
Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] Tom Price

 

I got a call from Cedar Lake Village yesterday.  The lady told me that she would pull back the bill she sent to
Edward Jones for March, 2023 and that there is no notice requirement when someone moves to a higher level
of care than what is currently provided.

 

So, no 30 day notice.  No March payment to Cedar Lake.

 

Edward Jones is scheduled to make the March 1 payment to the new placement.
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David C. Kirk
8000 Foster
Overland Park, KS 66204

Mailing:
P.O. Box 13304
Overland Park, KS 66282 
913 940-7600
Fax: 913 642-5860
E-Mail: dkirk121@yahoo.com

If you are not the intended recipient of this email, the sender requests that you destroy this email.

 

 

On Tuesday, February 21, 2023 at 02:18:57 PM CST, Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com> wrote:

 

 

David & Dan,

 

Hold the horses, we do not have to pay March.

 

Email form Deb forwarded. 
 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Beckwith,Deborah <dbeckwit@good-sam.com>
Date: Tue, Feb 21, 2023 at 2:14 PM
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Tom Price
To: Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>
Cc: Million,Robert <robert.million@good-sam.com>

 

Hi Jeff,

I am coping Rob on this so my Business Office is aware. 

If you have your Dad out by the last day of February, we will not be charging for March.  Rob can confirm that with
whoever is paying your Dad’s rent.
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I need to confirm with you that he is transferring to an Assisted Living facility.  If he moves to a higher level of care, we
terminate the agreement.  If he is moving to another Independent Living facility, then we need a 30 day notice, per the
Occupancy Agreement that he signed at move-in.

Can you please let me know where he is headed?

 

Lastly, who’s address or phone # do we use for forwarding mail?

 

Thank you

 

Deb Beckwith

Senior Living Administrator | Cedar Lake Village

15325 S Lone Elm Rd, Olathe, KS  66061

 

Phone: (913) 780-9916 | Email: dbeckwit@good-sam.com  | Fax:  (913)768-8903

www.cedarlakevillagekc.org | www.good-sam.com |  facebook.com/cedarlakevillagekc

 

 

 

 

 

 

From: Jeff Price <tom.j.price@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 21, 2023 1:42 PM
To: Beckwith,Deborah <dbeckwit@good-sam.com>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Tom Price

 

Deb,

 

I just want to confirm that the March billing will be the last payment
due, please confirm.

 

Jeff
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Disclaimer:  This email is intended only for the use of the party to which it is addressed and may contain information that is
privileged, confidential, or protected by law.  If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any dissemination,
copying or distribution of this email or its contents is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please notify us
immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer.

-----------------------------------------------------------------------
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail message, including any attachments,
is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain
privileged and confidential information.  Any unauthorized review, use,
disclosure or distribution is prohibited.  If you are not the intended
recipient, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy
all copies of the original message.

 

--

Disclaimer:  This email is intended only for the use of the party to which it is addressed and may contain information that is
privileged, confidential, or protected by law.  If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any dissemination,
copying or distribution of this email or its contents is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please notify us
immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer.
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